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NO MEETING GROUND 

India's return to ReEP not imminent 
New Delhi's 
insistence on at 
least 35% ROO 
widely at variance 
with accepted ReEP 
norm of ' minimal 
value addition' 

BANIKINKAR PATTANAYAK 
New Delhi, November 17 

SENIOR GOVERNMENT 
FUNCTIONARIES, including 
commerce and industry min­
ister Piyush Goyal, have indi­
cated post-Bangkok meet that 
India might reconsider its 
pullout from the Regional 
Comprehensive Partnership 
(RCEP) agreement if its "con­
cerns are adequately 
addressed", but that will be a 
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hard act to follow by potential 
partners. It is learnt that India's 
differences with others like 
China are too wide to be 
bridged soon, especially on the 
rules of origin (ROO) of 
imported products. 

While New De1hihas pitched 
for"suffidentvalueaddition" of 
at least 35% in the country of 
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exports for a product to be eligi­
ble for its tariff concession 
under the RCEP, others want to 
settle for just minimal value 
addition. India strongly feels 
that in the absence of strict rules 
of origin, its different tariffcon­
cessions for different countries 
(the offers are least ambitious 
for China) and safeguard/anti-

dumping tools against any 
irrational spike in imports Will 
be rendered meaningless and ' 
exporters from certain coun­
tries can easily violate the spirit 
of the agreement. -

For instance, a mobile 
phone that is excluded from 
the list of Chineseproducts-eli­
gible for duty concession in 
India can still land up here 
through Vietnam at a lower 
duty because the item is part of 
New Delhi's offer list for Hanoi. 
This is despite the fact that the 
entire mobile phone is made in 
China but gets exportedJo 
India from Vietnam after the 
supplier adds, say, just tam-
pered glass to it. I -

"lndia's condition forrules of 
originwouldbe among the most 
difficult proposals for countries 
like China to accede," said one of 
the sources. 
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can be easily thwarted byvested 
interests without tough rules of 
origin, said the source. 

A day after India decided to 
pull out of the 16-nation 
Regional Comprehensive Eco­
nomic Partnership (RCEP)ta1ks, 
commerce and industry minis­
ter Piyush Goyal on November 5 
indicated that New Delhi might 
get back at the negotiatingtable 
only if its demands - including 
extra safeguard mechanism to 
curb irrational spike in imports 
and tougher rules on the origin 
of imported products - were 
adequatelyaddressed.However, 
for now, the country had 
decided against joining the 
RCEP,he asserted.Although the 
15 other nations went ahead 
with the pact in November,they 
showed willingness to accom- · 
modate India's concerns. 

A joint statement of RCEP 
nations after the November 4 
summit in Bangkok, where 
Prime Minister Narendra Modi 
attended, was also silent on 
India's decision to pull out. It 
merely said: "India has signifi­
cant outstanding issues, which 
remain unresolved. All RCEP 
participating countries will 
work together to resolve these 
outstanding issues in a mutu­
allysatisfactoryway.India's final 
decision will depend on satis­
factory resolution of these 
issues. "This was a clear indica­
tion that others were keeping 
the doors open for India to join 
back should it so decide. 

After the pullout, Goyal said 
- India was unwi1lingto budge on 
its core demands on an "auto­
trigger" mechanism for safe­
guarding domestic industry 
fromdumping,despite pressure 
from partners.Also,itwas stead­
fast in demanding credible steps 
to address India's $105-billion 
trade deficit with RCEP mem­
bers, a more balanced deal on 
services,strict rules of origins of I 
products to check the abuse of 
tariff concessions and change in 
the base year to implement the 
tariff abolition from 2014 to 
2019. Moreover, it almost 
wanted its agriculture and dairy 
sector out of the RCEP negotia­
tions.Most members wanted to 
conclude the negotiations in 
2019 so that a deal can be for­
mallysigned in 2020. 

Asource had earlier said that 
Indiawas p1anning to employ an 
"auto-trigger" safeguard mech­
anism forimports from not just 
China but also Australia and 
New Zealand to better protect 
domestic players from irrational 
spike in imports. However, the , 

move was resisted. 
To protect its industry, India 

had decided to trim or remove 
tariffs on Chinese goods only in 
phases over a period of 20-25 
years. Similarly, its tariff conces­
sions was to be the least ambi­
tious for China-it offered to 
reduce or abolish import duties 
on a total of 80% of imports 
from China, against 86% from 
New Zealand and Australia, and 
90% from Asean, Japan and 
South Korea 

Even without RCEP, India's 
merchandise trade deficit with 
China stood at $53.6 billion in 
FY19,orneariya third ofits total 
deficit. Its deficit with potential 
RCEP members (including 
China)was as much as $105 bil­
lion in FY19. 


